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EVENT DESCRIPTION SHEET 

PROJECT 

Participant: 1 – YouNet APS 

PIC number: 949011238 

Project name and acronym:  WOmen in Resistance in the 20th century — WORTH 

 

EVENT DESCRIPTION 

Event number: WP2 

Event name: Implementation in Italy 

Type: Human Library event, Urban Trekking 

In situ/online: in-situ 

Location: Italy, Bologna 

Date(s): 28.02.2024; 07.05.2024 

Website(s) (if any): https://worth-cerv.weebly.com/  

Participants 

Female: 60 

Male: 22 

Non-binary: 0 

From country 1 [Italy]: 74 

From country 2 [Spain]: 4 

From country 3 [Poland]: 2 

From country 4 [Srilanka]: 1 

From country 5 [Turkey]: 1 

Total number of participants: 82 From total number of countries: 5 

Description 

Provide a short description of the event and its activities. 

Human Library Event in Bologna, Italy 

On February 28, 2024, YouNet hosted Human Library event at ITCS Salvemini High School in Bologna. The 
event brought to life the personal stories of extraordinary individuals, our "Human Books," who shared their 
experiences directly with the students, allowing them to engage with these stories intimately and closely. 

Among the Human Books who participated in this event, we had the privilege of hearing the experiences of 
members of ANPI Bologna (the National Association of the Italian Partisans). Each of them shared their life 
journeys and learnings, providing students with a unique and valuable perspective on various human 
experiences, with the focus on resistance of women in the conflicts of the 20

th
 century. The titles of the Human 
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Books included: 

 "So that it may be known. A partisan diary" 

 "My father survived the Russian retreat" 

 "Story of Liana, a little girl in history" 

 "Anna and activism in Ducati" 

 "The Book of the Borgo, Voices of Women" 

 "Dana's Courage" 

 "Story of a mixed couple during the racial laws" 

From stories of personal overcoming to tales of fighting for equality and social justice, each Human Book offered 
an authentic and enriching insight through their own words. The event gathered 47 participants, creating a 
powerful platform for intergenerational dialogue and understanding. 

Urban Trekking Events in Bologna, Italy 

On May 7, 2024, the WORTH Urban Trekking was organized through the streets of Bologna to uncover stories of 
courage and resistance of Italian women during the II World War. The event was hosted by YouNet in 
collaboration with the Technical Commercial Institute Rosa Luxemburg, and in gathered 38 participants, 
providing an opportunity to connect with the past and honor the remarkable contributions of women in the 
struggle for freedom and justice in Bologna. 

Urban trek followed from the Monumento Ossario ai Caduti Partigiani to Via Irma Bandiera and the Memoriale 
alle Donne Cadute per la Resistenza, exploring monuments rich in history and heroism.  

A highlight of the event was a narration by a member of ANPI Bologna the National Association of the Italian 
Partisans), who shared the inspiring story of Adelia Casari, known as ―Emma,‖ who fought for labor rights and 
contributed to the Villa Spada monument in honor of fallen fighters (Monumento alle Cadute partigiane). This 
monument, built in 1975, is dedicated to the 128 partisan women from Bologna who fell during the liberation 
struggle. Located inside Villa Spada Park, it features a two-meter wall with bricks bearing the names of fallen 
partisans, decorated by students to ensure the memory of the Resistance is continually renewed. 

The organized event was particularly engaging for the students, as it allowed them to learn about history in a 
unique and immersive way. By exploring significant locations in their city and uncovering the stories connected to 
women in resistance, the students gained a deeper understanding of the courageous efforts of those who fought 
against fascism and for the liberty of their country. 

Following the events, all participants were promptly provided with essential project data and a link to access the 
EUSurvey platform.  

 
HISTORY OF CHANGES 

VERSION PUBLICATION DATE CHANGE 
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